Town of North Hempstead

Commercial Clearwater Company, Inc

Authochem Corp.

In The Swim Discount Pool Supplies

Twin- County Swimming Pool

Keuhne Chemical Co., Inc.

Pool Chemicals

Paul Ribert Meilink

Jason Tortorella

Maintenance & Supply Co. Inc

David Zilberfarb, Director of Sales

TNH040-2017

P.O. Box 909

296 W Montauk Highway

320 Industrial Drive

797 Conklin Street

86 North Hackensack Avenue

Plandome, New York 11030

Hampton Bays, NY 11946

West Chicago, IL 60185

Farmingdale, NY 11735

South Kearny, NJ 07032

516-294-7985

631-283-7398

631-249-1249

973-589-0700

help@911pools.com

info@autochemcorp.com

karen@twincountypools.com

bids@kuehnecompany.com

Item # Item description Size Price Price Price Price Price
1 Diatomaceous earth, John Mansville 25 |b. bag $25.50 $22.00 no bid celton $14.35 no bid
# DE545 or equal, now called aquacell
*Include brand you are bidding
2 Sodium Bicarbonate, Powder 50 Ib. container $70.00 $21.00 no bid $22.65 no bid
3 Calcium Hypochlorite, granular 100 Ib. container $225.00 no bid no bid $201.40 no bid
unstabilized, 65% available chlorine
4 Sodium Hypochlorite, 15%, delivered 1 Tr'ﬂ'gﬁfi'on no bid per gallon $1.24 no bid gallon $1.45 per gallon $5.00
5 Muriatic Acid 15 gallon no bid 5 gallon carboy $26.50 plus $9.00 deposit per carboy $35.50 no bid no bid no bid
6 Oxalic Acid 50 Ib. bag $183.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
7 Testing tablets #1 Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $46.00 lamotte $55.00 no bid $43.55 no bid
*Include brand you are bidding
8 Testing Tablet # 3 Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $46.00 lamotte $55.00 no bid $43.55 no bid
*Include brand you are bidding
9 Testing Tablet Phenol red, Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $46.00 lamotte $55.00 no bid $43.55 no bid
*Include Brand you are bidding
10 Testing Tablets, Calcium Hardness 1000 tablets $46.00 lamotte $55.00 no bid $43.55 no bid
*Brand you are bidding
11 Testing Tablets Alkalinity M/2 1000 tablets $46.00 lamotte $55.00 no bid $43.55 no bid
*Brand You are bidding
12 Lamotte test kits, Model # PM 51NJ, or equivalent Each $110.00 model: pm51nj$77.00 no bid $90.25 no bid
*Brand you are bidding
*15 Glass test tubes for water testing 24 tubes $4.80 per tube $115.20 no bid no bid each $4.19 no bid
16 Tri-Sodium Phosphate 50 Ib. container no bid no bid no bid NB no bid
50 Ib. bag
17 Calcium Chloride Flakes, 77% With 50 bag $28.00 per bag $1400.00 per bag $18.45 (50 bag min delivery) no bid $19.79 no bid
minimum delivery
18 25 Ib bags purifier 100 bags $49.00 per bag $4,900.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
19 Sodium Thiosulfate 5 Ib containers $32.00 25 Ib bucket $60.00 no bid no bid no bid
20 3 1/8 " calcium hypochlorite Tablets, Hydrated 55 |bs 501bs $122.50 vantage $108.00 no bid $196.50 no bid
100lbs $219.75

*ITEM NOT BEING AWARDED*
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