

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixnstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
1	TYPE 1 CEMENT	94 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$10.25
2	TYPE 2 CEMENT	94 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$10.25
3	TYPE 3 CEMENT	94 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$14.99
4	TYPE N MASONRY CEMENT	74 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$8.99
5a.	QUIKRETE, FAST SETTING CONCRETE MIX #1	50 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$9.50
b.	QUIKRETE, 5000 CONCRETE MIX #1007	80 Lb. BAG	EACH BAG	NO BID	-	\$6.45
6	TRANSIT MIX - NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS A 3800 POUND TEST ,			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$93.00	\$109.89
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU. YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$93.00	\$105.89
7	TRANSIT MIX - NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS A 3800 POUND TEST , WITH 1% CALCIUM, FALL MIX			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$94.00	\$119.89
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$94.00	\$114.89
8	TRANSIT MIX - NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS A 3800 POUND TEST , WITH 2% CALCIUM, WINTER MIX			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$123.89
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$118.89
9	TRANSIT MIX - NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS B 4000 POUND TEST			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$95.00	\$114.98
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$95.00	\$113.98
10	TRANSIT MIX- NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS B 400 POUND TEST, WITH 1% CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FALL MIX			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$119.98
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$119.89
11	TRANSIT MIX- NASSAU COUNTY & NY STATE DOT APPROVED- CLASS B 400 POUND TEST, WITH 2% CALCIUM CHLORIDE, WINTER MIX			NO BID		
a.	Minimum 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$98.00	\$119.98
b.	Minimum 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$98.00	\$119.98
12	CONCRETE, READY MIX, 1-2-4- GRAVEL, CLASS B			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$92.00	\$119.98
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$92.00	\$119.89
13	CONCRETE, READY MIX, 1-2-4- GRAVEL, CLASS B, 1% CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FALL MIX			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$93.00	\$119.98
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$93.00	\$119.98
14	CONCRETE, READY MIX, 1-2-4- GRAVEL, CLASS B, 2% CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FALL MIX			NO BID		
a.	MINIMUM 3 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$119.98
b.	MINIMUM 5 CU.YD. DELIVERIES	CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	NO BID	\$96.00	\$119.98
15	CEMENT BRICK , COMMON - DOT APPROVED	BRICK	EACH	NO BID	-	\$0.68

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixnstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
16a.	CEMENT BLOCK, 4"X8"X16" BLOCK HOLLOW	CEMENT BLOCK	EACH	NO BID	-	\$1.25
b.	CEMENT BLOCK, 4"X8"X16" BLOCK - SOLID			NO BID	-	\$1.90
c.	CEMENT BLOCK , 8" X 8" X16" - HOLLOW	CEMENT BLOCK	EACH	NO BID	-	\$2.19
17	SAND , FINE , STATE APPROVED SOURCE ONLY - NASSAU COUNTY STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS D.P.W. 1964 MATERIALS OF CONSTRUCTION , PART 2, SECTION B - M3 IN ADDITION, THE GRADATIONS REQUIREMENTS SHALL BE AS FOLLLOWS: PASSING 3/8" SIEVE 100 PASSING 1/4" SIEVE 95-100 PASSING #4 SIEVE 90-100 PASSING #16 SIEVE 55-70 PASSING #50 SIEVE 10-30 PASSING #100 SIEVE 1-8 PASSING #200 SIEVE 0-2 ALL OF THE ABOVE SIEVES SHALL CONFORM TO ASTM INTERNATIONAL STANDARD DES E -11- 39. ORGANIC IMPURITIES STANDARD OR LIGHTER.					
a.	MINIMUM 40 TON DELIVERY	TON	PER TON	NO BID	\$25.00	\$32.50
b.	MINIMUM 20 TON DELIVERY	TON	PER TON	NO BID	\$27.00	\$39.50
18	WELD - CRETE	GALLON	PER GALLON	NO BID		\$29.99
19	# 5 REBAR, DOMESTIC	20' LENGTH	EACH	NO BID		\$11.96
20	# 6 REBAR, DOMESTIC	20' LENGTH	EACH	NO BID		\$16.86
21	# 7 REBAR, DOMESTIC	20' LENGTH	EACH	NO BID		\$22.95
22	4" EXPANSION JOINTS, CANE FIBER	10 X 1/2"	EACH	NO BID		\$2.73
23	6" EXPANSION JOINTS, CANE FIBER	10 X 1/2"	EACH	NO BID		\$4.06
24	8" EXPANSION JOINTS, CANE FIBER	10 X 1/2"	EACH	NO BID		\$6.75
25	WIRE MESH SHEETS, #661010	5' X 10'	EACH	NO BID		\$8.28
	LIFT	50 PIECES	PER 50	NO BID		\$7.28
26	WIRE MESH SHEETS, #6666	5' X 10'	EACH	NO BID		\$16.55
	LIFT	50 PIECES	PER 50	NO BID		\$15.55
27	FIBERMESH	1LB	PER LB	NO BID		\$8.95
28	CRUSHED BLUE STONE. Must be clean with no foreign materials such as trash, wood, construction debris, steel, etc.					
a.	SCREENED SIZE 1/4" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$74.99
b.	SCREENED SIZE 3/8" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$70.99
c.	SCREENED SIZE 1/2" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$74.99
d.	SCREENED SIZE 5/8" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$59.99
e.	SCREENED SIZE 1/4" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$74.99
f.	SCREENED SIZE 3/8" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$70.99
g.	SCREENED SIZE 1/2" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$74.99
h.	SCREENED SIZE 5/8" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$59.99
29	PEA GRAVEL ROUND WASHED -					
a.	SCREENED SIZE 3/8" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$79.99
b.	SCREENED SIZE 3/4" - DELIVERED	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$79.99
c.	SCREENED SIZE 3/8" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$79.99
d.	SCREENED SIZE 3/4" - PICK UP	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$79.99
30	PAVERS - CAMBRIDGE with ARMORTEK or EQUIVALENT ** Identify Brand and Model if not Cambridge			NO BID	-	(NICOLock Standard COLORS)
a.	6" x 9"	SQUARE FOOT	PER SQUARE FOOT	NO BID	-	\$2.65
b.	4"x 8"	SQUARE FOOT	PER SQUARE FOOT	NO BID	-	\$2.65
c.	6" x 6"	SQUARE FOOT	PER SQUARE FOOT	NO BID	-	\$2.65

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixnstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
d.	8" x 8"	SQUARE FOOT	PER SQUARE FOOT	NO BID	-	\$2.65
e.	12" x 12"	SQUARE FOOT	PER SQUARE FOOT	NO BID	-	\$2.75
31	PAVING AND RETAINING WALL SUPPLIES -			NO BID	-	
a.	NICOLOCK, DELIVERED	COMPLETE CATALOGUE	PERCENT OFF LIST PRICE	NO BID	-	10%
b.	NICOLOCK, PICK UP	COMPLETE CATALOGUE	PERCENT OFF LIST PRICE	NO BID	-	15%
c.	CAMBRIDGE, DELIVERED	COMPLETE CATALOGUE	PERCENT OFF LIST PRICE	NO BID	-	30%
d.	CAMBRIDGE, PICK UP	COMPLETE CATALOGUE	PERCENT OFF LIST PRICE	NO BID	-	30%
	*MUST SUPPLY CATALOG for NICOLOCK AND COST BOOK for CAMBRIDGE			NO BID		
32	LEDGE STONE CIRCLER KIT - CAMBRIDGE with ARMOR TEK or EQUIVALENT	KIT	EACH	NO BID	-	\$339.89 Standard Colors
33	WALL STONE - CAMBRIDGE with ARMOR TEK or EQUIVALENT			NO BID		(Sft.)
a.	OLD ENGLISH	LINEAR FOOT	PER LINEAR FOOT	NO BID	-	\$12.15 per Sft (Verona)
b.	VYKING	LINEAR FOOT	PER LINEAR FOOT	NO BID	-	\$7.89 per Sft (Alta/AltaPro)
c.	PYZIQUE	LINEAR FOOT	PER LINEAR FOOT	NO BID	-	\$12.52 per Sft (Serafina)
d.	MAYTRX	LINEAR FOOT	PER LINEAR FOOT	NO BID	-	\$10.89 per Sft (3"/6" Colonial)
34	GLUE- CONSTRUCTION ADHESIVE			NO BID	-	
a.	PL 400 GLUE 10 oz	10 oz. BOTTLE	EACH	NO BID	-	\$2.98
b.	PL 400 GLUE 28 oz	28 oz. BOTTLE	EACH	NO BID	-	\$4.98
c.	GUNS 10oz	10 oz. GUN	EACH	NO BID	-	\$4.99
d.	GUNS 28oz	28 oz. GUN	EACH	NO BID	-	\$14.99
35	CONCRETE PINS DOMESTIC STEEL			NO BID	-	
a.	24"	24" PIN	EACH	NO BID	-	\$34.98
b.	30"	30" PIN	EACH	NO BID	-	\$39.98
c.	36"	36" PIN	EACH	NO BID	-	\$44.98
36	CONCRETE PIPE			NO BID	-	N/B
a.	12" x 8'	12" x 8'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
b.	18" x 8'	18" x 8'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
c.	24" x 8'	24" x 8'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	12" x 10'	12" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
e.	18" x 10'	18" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
f.	24" x 10'	24" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
g.	12" x 12'	12" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
h.	18" x 12'	18" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
i.	24" x 12'	24" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
37	PIPE SDR SOLID - WHITE			NO BID	-	
a.	4" x 10'	4" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$9.89
b.	6" x 10'	6" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$27.55
c.	8" x 10'	8" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" x 10'	10" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" x 10'	12" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
f.	15" x 10'	15" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
g.	18" x 10'	18" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
h.	21" x 10'	21" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
i.	24" x 10'	24" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
j.	4" x 12'	4" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
k.	6" x 12'	6" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
l.	8" x 12'	8" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
m.	10" x 12'	10" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
n.	12" x 12'	12" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
38	PIPE SDR SOLID- GREEN			NO BID		
a.	4" x 10'	4" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$18.89
b.	6" x 10'	6" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$39.89
c.	8" x 10'	8" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" x 10'	10" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" x 10'	12" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
f.	15" x 10'	15" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
g.	18" x 10'	18" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
h.	21" x 10'	21" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
i.	24" x 10'	24" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
j.	4" x 12'	4" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
k.	6" x 12'	6" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
l.	8" x 12'	8" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
m.	10" x 12'	10" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
n.	12" x 12'	12" x 12'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
39	PIPE SDR PERFORATED WHITE			NO BID		
a.	4" x 10'	4" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$9.89
b.	6" x 10'	6" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$27.55
c.	8" x 10'	8" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" x 10'	10" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" x 10'	12" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
40	PIPE SDR PERFORATED GREEN			NO BID		
a.	4" x 10'	4" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$18.89
b.	6" x 10'	6" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$39.89
c.	8" x 10'	8" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" x 10'	10" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" x 10'	12" x 10'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
41	BELGIUM BLOCK (New)			NO BID		
a.	Large	LARGE	EACH	NO BID	-	\$3.70
b.	Small	SMALL	EACH	NO BID	-	\$2.67
42	GEO GRID			NO BID		
a.	4' x 50'	4' x 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$54.89
b.	6' x 50'	6' x 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$81.89
c.	4' x 100'	4' x 100'	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	6' x 100'	6' x 100'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$242.89 (6' x 150')
43	FILTER FABRIC	12' x 300'	EACH	NO BID	-	469.89 (12' x 400')
44	GABION STONE WITH BASKETS			NO BID		
a.	3"	3"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
b.	4"	4"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
c.	5"	5"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
45	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS WHITE			NO BID		
a.	4" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$3.89
b.	4" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$3.89
c.	4" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	\$4.18
d.	4" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	\$4.18
e.	4" COUPLING			NO BID	-	\$2.99
f.	4" TEE			NO BID	-	\$4.89
g.	4" WYE			NO BID	-	\$5.25
46	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS GREEN			NO BID		
a.	4" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$23.61
b.	4" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$18.77
c.	4" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	4" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	4" COUPLING			NO BID	-	\$23.17
f.	4" TEE			NO BID	-	\$30.43
g.	4" WYE			NO BID	-	\$32.35
47	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS WHITE			NO BID		
a.	6" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$11.60
b.	6" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$11.66
c.	6" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	6" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	6" COUPLING			NO BID	-	\$7.61
f.	6" TEE			NO BID	-	\$16.95
g.	6" WYE			NO BID	-	\$24.00
48	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS GREEN			NO BID		
a.	6" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$43.39
b.	6" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$38.06
c.	6" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
d.	6" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	6" COUPLING			NO BID	-	\$46.29
f.	6" TEE			NO BID	-	\$65.08
g.	6" WYE			NO BID	-	\$74.29
49	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS WHITE			NO BID	-	
a.	8" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
b.	8" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
c.	8" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	8" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	8" COUPLING			NO BID	-	N/B
f.	8" TEE			NO BID	-	N/B
g.	8" WYE			NO BID	-	N/B
50	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS GREEN			NO BID	-	
a.	8" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$120.07
b.	8" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	\$106.55
c.	8" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	8" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	8" COUPLING			NO BID	-	\$78.59
f.	8" TEE			NO BID	-	\$65.08
g.	8" WYE			NO BID	-	\$74.29
51	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS WHITE			NO BID	-	N/B
a.	10" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
b.	10" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
c.	10" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	10" COUPLING			NO BID	-	N/B
f.	10" TEE			NO BID	-	N/B
g.	10" WYE			NO BID	-	N/B
52	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS GREEN			NO BID	-	N/B
a.	10" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
b.	10" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
c.	10" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	10" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	10" COUPLING			NO BID	-	N/B
f.	10" TEE			NO BID	-	N/B
g.	10" WYE			NO BID	-	N/B
53	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS WHITE			NO BID	-	N/B
a.	12" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
b.	12" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
c.	12" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	12" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" COUPLING			NO BID	-	N/B
f.	12" TEE			NO BID	-	N/B
g.	12" WYE			NO BID	-	N/B
54	ASSORTED ELBOWS & CONNECTORS GREEN			NO BID	-	N/B
a.	12" 90 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
b.	12" 45 DEGREE ELBOW			NO BID	-	N/B
c.	12" COMMERCIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
d.	12" RESIDENTIAL DOWNSPOUT ADAPTOR			NO BID	-	N/B
e.	12" COUPLING			NO BID	-	N/B
f.	12" TEE			NO BID	-	N/B
g.	12" WYE			NO BID	-	N/B
55	RCA – RECYCLED CONCRETE AGGREGATE	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$20.00	\$19.98
56	BLUE STONE DUST	YARD	PER YARD	NO BID	\$60.00	\$69.99
57	BLUE STONE DUST	50 lb. Bag	EACH	NO BID	-	\$5.99
58	ZERO SAND	50 lb. Bag	EACH	NO BID	-	\$8.99
59	CONTRACTOR BAGS/BLACK 42 GAL			NO BID	-	
a.	3Mil (*Include Number of Bags per Box)	*	BOX	NO BID	-	\$9.89 (20)
b.	6Mil (*Include Number of Bags per Box)	*	BOX	NO BID	-	N/B
60	PL PREMIUM ADHESIVE-			NO BID	-	
a.	10 OZ TUBE	10 OZ TUBE	EACH	NO BID	-	\$4.99
b.	29 OZ TUBE	29 OZ TUBE	EACH	NO BID	-	\$9.75
61	MURIATIC ACID	GALLON	PER GALLON	NO BID	-	\$5.25
62	WEED BLOCK	6"x 50' ROLL	EACH	NO BID	-	\$29.16

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixnstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
63a.	SAND BAG- PLASTIC (empty)	14" X 26" (approx)	EACH	NO BID	-	\$0.38
b.	SAND BAG- BURLPAP	14" X 30" (approx)	EACH	NO BID	-	\$1.89
64	Cast in place Detectable/Tactile Warning surface - (Yellow) or (Blue)			NO BID	-	
a.	12" x 12"	12" x 12"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
b.	24" x 24"	24" x 24"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
c.	24" x 36"	24" x 36"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	24" x 48"	24" x 48"	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
65	PLASTIC SHEATHING- 4 Mil			NO BID		
a.	10' x 25' Roll	10' x 25' ROLL	PER ROLL	NO BID	-	\$8.99
b.	10' X 100'	10' X 100' ROLL	PER ROLL	NO BID	-	\$26.50
c.	20' X 100'	20' X 100' ROLL	PER ROLL	NO BID	-	\$52.60
66	PLASTIC SHEATHING - 6 Mil			NO BID		
a.	10' X 100' Roll	10' X 100' ROLL	PER ROLL	NO BID	-	\$38.52
b.	20' X 100' Roll	20' X 100' ROLL	PER ROLL	NO BID	-	\$82.47
67	ORANGE SAFETY FENCE	4' X 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$28.50
68	ALUMINIUM FLASHING			NO BID		
a.	6" X 50'	6" X 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$12.99
b.	8" X 50'	8" X 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$17.99
c.	10" X 50'	10" X 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$19.99
d.	12" X 50'	12" X 50'	EACH	NO BID	-	\$23.99
69	POLYMERIC SAND			NO BID		
a.	GRAY	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$25.10
b.	BEIGE	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$23.10
70	6" GREEN HEAVY DUTY U STYLE STEEL FENCE POST 13 GAUGE	EACH	EACH	NO BID	-	\$8.98
71	FENCE POST DRIVER WEIGHTED & REINFORC	MIDWEST MODEL #901147A	EACH	NO BID	-	\$24.18
72	QUIKRETE VINYL CONCRETE PATCH #1133	40 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$13.16
73	PACKAGE PAVEMENT ECO FRIENDLY HP BLACKTOP PATCH #102205	60Lbs.	EACH	\$6.95/ Bag GreenPatch (Min 1 pallet 50 Bags)	-	\$9.78
74	PACKAGE PAVEMENT ALL WEATHER ECO- FRIENDLY BLACKTOP PATCH #102306	60Lbs.	EACH	\$6.95/ Bag GreenPatch (Min 1 pallet 50 Bags)	-	\$8.78
75	GREEN COLD PATCH- 80-100 % Recycled Envir	60Lbs.	EACH	\$6.95/ Bag GreenPatch (Min 1 pallet 50 Bags)	-	N/B
76a.	CALCIUM CHLORIDE PELLETS 97% PURE DOM	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$22.89
b.	CALCIUM CHLORIDE PELLETS 95% PURE IMP	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$17.89
77	HYDRAULIC CEMENT			NO BID		
a.	GREY- 10 Lbs.	10 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$16.32
b.	GREY- 50 Lbs.	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	\$47.66
c.	WHITE- 10 Lbs.	10 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
d.	WHITE- 50 Lbs.	50 Lbs.	EACH	NO BID	-	N/B
78	Mortar Hoe, Blade Approx 7"-10" handle 54"-66"			NO BID		\$27.98
79	Jackson M6 Wheel Barrel Jackson Pro: 027- 6 CU ft Steel Tray			NO BID		\$128.69
80	Marshalltown Trades Tool catalog	Discount % off list		NO BID		30%
81	Goldblatt Trades Tool Catalog	Discount % off list		NO BID		20%
82	Kraft Trades Tool Catalog	Discount % off list		NO BID		20%
83	Mortar Pans Steel	3 cu ft EA		NO BID		\$29.89
A.	Mortar Pans Plastic	3 cu ft EA		NO BID		\$25.68
84	Cable Cord-Mason Line	250 ft Mason line		NO BID		\$3.25

TNH012-2019-Concrete, Fine Sand & Masonry				Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp	D & A Sand and Gravel Inc.	Phoenix Building Products, Inc.
				65 Edison Ave	335 Sagamore Ave	321 Denton Ave.
				Mount Vernon, NY 10550	Mineola, NY 11501	New Hyde Park, NY 11040
				Dario Amicucci		Jonathan Brienza
				718-463-1444	516-248-9444	
				ORDERS@GREENPATCH.COM	EP22@aol.com	JonathanB@stixnstones.com
	Items	Unit	Unit to Be Priced	Price	Price	Price
85	Caution Barrier Tape	3" X 1000' Rolls		NO BID		\$6.89