TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

sosullivan@Harrells.com

pat.cash@heritageppg.com

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

631-368-8022 Shawn O'Sullivan Pat Cash Ken Kraus John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O John Banks dpughe@nsturf.com Mark Magnarella Tom Pepe 609-751-1372
LOCAL VENDOR LOCAL VENDOR
Section 1- Fungicides-(non-agency products) Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Chipco 26 GT $695/2.5 gal
1|3 gallcase — N/A $1,150.00 $600.00/cs NB _ NB $1097.64 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Chipco 26 GT
Product you are bidding on $1390/5 gal case
Cost per case
Chipco 26019 EPA # 432-888 $190/2.5 gal
pfpgallcase — NIA $355.00 $425.00/cs NB _ NB $367.19 per 5 gallon case NIA No Bid Chipco 26019 EPA 432-888
Product you are bidding on $380/5 gal case
Cost per case
gLT"720 or generic equivalent $153.29 per 5 gallon case $88/2.5 gal
3 FQZC—ESE T N/A $270.00 $170.00/cs NB _ NB ArmorTech CLT 720 N/A No Bid Chorotalonil 720
Product you are bidding on $176/gal case
Dithane 75DF
$87/12 Ib
448l case - N/A $320.00 $269.00/cs NB _ NB $2fﬂ3'ii Fierp“rg.'g'ffse N/A No Bid Dithane
FC’rotiuct you are bidding on anzate Pro-Stc $348/48Lb case
ost per case
Eagle 20 EW. $188/gal
s ga;l/case — N/A $800.00 $189.00/gal NB NB 38§'i/|3 por 2 gallon case NIA No Bid Eagle 20 EW
C:;tl:;etryg:s:re i0ding on Y $752/4 gal case
gluaﬁlnam or generic equivalent $312.49 per gallon $325/gal
gjpaaicase — N/A $2,350.00 NB NB B NB $1249.96 per 4 gal cs. N/A No Bid Dnax
FC’rotiuct you are bidding on Armortech Rotator $1300/4 gal case
ost per case
g"efilﬂoxam 2AQ $345.00/Gallon $995/2.5gal
7 —QZC—ESe T N/A No Bid $2280.00/cs NB $690.00/Case - 2x1 GallCase NB $1987.89 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Mefanoxam 2AQ
Zroc;tuc;ryg;;re idding on Mefanoxam $1990/5 gal case
:rggll(/:onazole or generic equivalent Propiconazole $200/2.5gal
812 s case — N/A $435.00 $879.00/cs NB $188.00/2.5 Gal  2x2.5 gal case NB $389.59 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Propiconazole
Cro tuct you are bicding on $376.00/case $400/5 gal case
ost per case
Proplant or generic equivalent $315 per gallon $315/gal
9 39‘3'“—35‘3 — N/A No Bid NB NB B NB Pzrz dlufﬁl E;Snfa N/A No Bid Karma
Product you are bidding on $630/2 gal case(local/Tie Breaker
Cost per case $630 per case
Protégé or generic equivalent $829.53 per gallon
joj2X Lgallcase __ N/A No Bid NB NB B NB 4x1 galicase N/A No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on Azoxy D Select
Cost per case $3318.12 per per 4 gallcs
Tebuconazole $85/gal
11 2)( dl alicase — N/A $490.00 $99.00/GAL NB B NB 27;'::0‘?&‘}: %aE"‘gg;gse N/A No Bid Tebuconazole 3.6F
croostucéryg;;re ldding on $340/4 gal case
Terrazole L
1|2 gallcase — N/A $1,400.00 $195.00/QT NB B NB No bid N/A No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost per case
';h(lsopli/hanate Methyl or generic equivalent T-methyl Qualipro 26111 er 5 aallon case $120/2.5 gal
1312 Z £ase T N/A $384.00 $199.00/CASE NB 2x2.5 gallcase NB Armff nechgTM 262 N/A No Bid T-Storm
c’g"stuce‘ryé’;sife [ccing on $145.00/2.5gal/$290.00/Case $240/5 gal case
Armor Tech Zoxy 2F or generic equivalent $240/gal
14|AX Lgallcase __ N/A $1,540.00 $249.99/gal NB _ NB 303.21 per gallon N/A No Bid AZOXY 25¢
Product you are bidding on $1,212.84 per 4 gallcs. $960.00 case
Cost per case )
Armor Tech Zoxy T or generic equivalent
4 X 1 gal/lcase . $293.47 per gallon . .
15|22 2 gajcase N/A No Bid NB NB NB N/A No Bid No bid
Product you are bidding on - $1,173.88 per 4 gal/cs.
Cost per case
Section 2 - Herbicides-(non-agency products)
g‘\cdi,m Extra $797.23 per gallon 4)3942(%2'56
1|2 darcase — N/A $3,750.00 NB NB B NB 4x1 gallcs. N/A No Bid g
Product you are bidding on Acclaim Extra
$3,188.92 per 4 gallcs
Cost per case $3760.00/4 gal
Drive XLR8 Alternate
$65/640z
174X 640z N/A $260.00 $54.99/6402 NB NB $65.29 per 64 0z. N/A No Bid Drive XLR8

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

QP Quinclorac 1.5L
$261.17 per 4x64 oz/cs.

$260/2 gal case.
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Fusilade 2
$89.06/qt
1g|Quarticase — N/A $95/qt $95.00/qt NB X NB No bid N/A No Bid Fusilade 2
Product you are bidding on $89.06/Qt
Cost per case )
Slyplr;osphate 2X2.5 GallCase $225.33 per 5 gallon case $11472.5 gal
Ty N/A No Bid $93.00/2.5 Jug NB Credit Extra NB oF o e o Pl N/A No Bid Ranger Pro
ZFOOS tuiryco:sire idding on $60.00/2.5 Gall$120.00/case Yphosp $228/5 gal case
4 speed XT $242/2.5 gal
o0|2galcase — N/A No Bid $299.00/2.5 Jug NB B NB $517.47 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid 4 Speed XT
E:}os(il:)cetry;):szre bidding on $228/5 gal case
Quicksilver Herbicide $190/80z
21 3203 case — N/A $900.00 NB NB _ NB $621.21 per 32 oz. case N/A No Bid Quicksilver Herbicide
ZrooS tucetrycoﬁtljszre idding on $760/320z case
i’éoS;dsge /HEI’bICIde or generic equivalent $70/1.330z bottle
pojplxloozicase N/A $750.00 $79.00/1.30z NB NB $621.33 per 10x1.3 oz. case N/A No Bid Sedgehammer
Product you are bidding on Sedgemaster $700/10x1.3 0z case
Cost per case $46.00/1.33 0z $460.00/case .
fgdqlegan}mer Herbicide $70/1.330z bottle
23jixlo0zcase N/A $750.00 NB NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Sedgemaster
Zroo:uct you are bidding on $700/10x1.3 oz case
ost per case
Se aﬁ?ce:ste“ $781.25/2.5 gal
242 gavcas — N/A $1,500.00 $315.00/gal NB _ NB $1,302.09 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Segment Il
FC’rotiuct you are bidding on $1562.50/5 gal case
ost per case
gcyﬂl"lle $199/2.5 gal
252 dacase — N/A No bid NB NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Scythe
Zroc;(:uc;ryggszre bidding on $398/5 gal case
Triamine Jet Spray
12 X 230z/case WEED WHACKER i i i
26 N/A 170.00 NB NB no bid N/A No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on $ 12X220Z $8.85/220Z -
Cost per case
Trimec Bentgrass $159/2.5 gal
27 39‘3'“—35‘3 — N/A No Bid $156.00/2.5JUG NB B NB no bid N/A No Bid Trimec Bentgrass
ZrooS tuc;yg;;re idding on $318/5 gal case
IEJelfllJal? 22 $40/40lb bag
28 239 — N/A No Bid $43.80/BAG NB NB $33.33 per 40lb bag N/A No Bid Treflan .5G
Product you are bidding on Treflan 5G $40/40lb bag
Cost per bag $28.50/40LB
Sarlloln $200/2.5 gal
29 —SIZC—E‘S‘e — N/A $460.00 $74.37/GAL NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Garlon
ZrooS tuc;yg;;re idding on $400/5 gal case
Baracade .48% DG Pro (Anderson — Crab Grass pre-emerge) $40.95/50Ib bag
30j&5 Callonfcase __ N/A No Bid $42.50/BAG NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Barricade .48% DG Pro
Zroc;(:uc;ryggszre bidding on $40.95/50Ib bag
Burnout Il Concentrate $108/gal
31 H?’L“e — N/A No Bid NB Balouka 8 x .5g! $419.00 _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Burnout Il
Zroc;tlécelryg;sire S $432/4 gal case
Section 3 - Insecticides-(non-agency products)
M-Pede Soap Concentrate $130/2.5 gal
32 §-5dGa”°“’0ase — N/A No Bid NB $194.50 _ NB no bid N/A No Bid M-Pede Soap Concentrate
C:)c;tl:)cetry;):szre idding on $260/5 gal case
Damoil Drexel Horticultural Oil $36.00/2.5 gal
33fa5 Gallonfcase N/A No Bid NB NB : NB no bid N/A No Bid Damoil Drexel Hnt Ol
Product you are bidding on Damoil - Drexel $36.00/5 gal case
Cost per case $28.00/2.5 Gal, $56.00/case i
Carbaryl 4L or generic equivalent $147/2.5 gal
34| gallcase NIA No Bid $285.00/CASE NB NB $347.71 per 5 gallon case NIA No Bid Lesco Sevin SL

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

$294/5 gal Case
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3

4]

Dylox 420 SL

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$500.00

$630.00/CASE

NB

NB

$479.91 per 5 gallon case

N/A

No Bid

$313/2.5 gal
Dylox 420 SL T&O
$626/5 gal case

3

[

Dylox (granular)

30 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$65.00

$59.99/BAG

NB

NB

$59 per 30LB bag

N/A

No Bid

$64.00/30Ib bag
Dylox(granular)
$64.00 30Ib Dylox (granular)

3

X

Lambda-Cy

1 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

$200.00/GAL

NB

NB

alternate
$439.41 per 6x1qt/cs.
QP Lambda GC-0

N/A

No Bid

$65/gal
Lambda - Cy
260/4 gal case

38

Tempo SC Ultra

12 X 240 ml/case

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

900ML $225.00/900ML

NB

NB

$209.17 per 900ml. Bottle

N/A

No Bid

$61/240 ml bottle
Tempo SC Ultra
$732/12 240 ml bottles

39

#567 Pyrethrin & Insecticidal Soap Concentrate

32 fl ounce container

Product you are bidding

Cost per container

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

Section 4 - Fertilizers

4

o

Osmocote Smart Release

Product you are bidding

8 Ib bag price

10 Ib bag price

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

41

5-3-1 Gro Power*

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

78.90 (no subs)

No Bid

17.95 bag
50LB Bag
Bioplex 5-3-1

4

N

10-2-5 Gro Power*

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

72.50 (no subs)

No Bid

27.65 bag
50LB Bag
12-3-5 Bioplex

43

0-0-10 Gro Power*

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

5-0-15 greens 2 min w/ gypsum
1Fe Turf King 50lb $60.00

NB

no bid

76.50(no subs)

No Bid

62.70 40LB Bag
Andersons
0-0-25 Contec DG

4

IS

0-0-16 Bio Performa *

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

0-0-20 2% MN greens w/gypsum
Turf King 50lb $52.50

NB

no bid

68.50(no subs)

No Bid

55.20 40LB Bag
Andersons
0-0-12 MagTec

45

8-0-12 Gro Power *

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

10.0 -15 Fairway 50% Organic
Turf King 50LB $32.00

NB

no bid

69.75(no subs)

No Bid

No Bid

46

11-2-9/Fe+Mn Gro Power

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

$74.92

No Bid

No Bid

a7

6-18-8 Gro Power*

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

$75.50

No Bid

No Bid

48

20-0-6 .86% Pendi

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

20-0-4 $35.00/BAG

NB

NB

$25.23 per 50LB bag
TCS 20-0-4 w .86% pendi

N/A

No Bid

36.50/bag
Lebanon
20-0-4 .86% Pendi

4

©

21-0-21

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$69.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$37.95 p/bag
50 Ib bag
21-0-21 75% xcu

No Bid

50

30-0-5 Polyon with Barricade

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$60.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

26-0-10 Harrells Polyon*
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51

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$44.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

52

23-0-20 Harrells Polyon

50 |b bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$69.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

53

12-0-12 50% SRN

bulk delivery by ton

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$3309.90 p/ton
minimum order 1.06 tons (200 gallons)
187 gallons in 1 ton
12-0-12 50% SRN

No Bid

54

25-0-10 Uflexx fairway grade

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

$50.00 /BAG

NB

NB

$36.19 per 50lb bag
Armortech 26-0-10
SGN 195

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

5!

1

8-2-2 Earthworks*

500Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

$350/bag (sold per pallet 4 x5001b)

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

56

3-3-3 Earthworks*

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

4-4-4 $150.00/BAG

Nature Sate 5-6-6 greens
(Pallet-Minimum) $44.45

$40.00/bag (no subs)

$25.35 per 50lb bag Healthy
Grow 2-4-3

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

5

J

10-34-0 Plant Food*

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$170.00
Harrell's Phos Plus

8-27-2 AMP $140.00/2.5JUG

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$129.50 p/case
5 gallon case

No Bid

58

Phusion Gypsum

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$21.40 p/bag
50Ib bag.
Phusion Gypsum

22.15/bag
Sol-U-Cal S
$22.15/50lb bag

59

Verdecal-Gcourse

50 |b bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$23.00

NB

Cal Plus-Calcium w/Apex
Apex is humic acid Turf King $19.25

NB

$13.29 per 50LB
Alternate
EC+ w/Humoxy 36%
Enhanced Calcium

N/A

No Bid

$27.98/50LB
Anddersons Gypsom DG Elite

60

Cal Sol Gypsum Greens Grade

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$25.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$35.00
Solu- Cal S Greens Grade

61

20-20-20

25lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$55.00

$65.00/BAG

NB

NB

$53.21 per 25LB Bag

N/A

No Bid

$48/25 Ib bag
Ultra/Sol
$48.00/25Ib bag

62

19-0-9 Lebanon Country Club 195 sgn

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

17-0-4- Bio Solid $27.00

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$39.00/bag
Lebanon 18-0-8 150 SGN
$39/50LB Bag

63

8-45-12 Bio Performa*

25Lb bucket

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

NB

Hi Phos-10-48-8 25#
"Protea” $147.75

NB

no bid

$98.00

No Bid

64

10-5-40 Bio Performa*

25Lb bucket

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

NB

Quin K 13-0-41 25#
Protea $147.45

NB

no bid

$105.00

No Bid

6!

1

18-0-6

275 galtote

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

$2250.00/250GAL

"AaNswer" 31-0-0
275 gl $3,985.00

NB

$2,209.73 per 275 gal tote
Nutrite
18-0-6-50% SRN

N/A

$4867.50 p/tote
18-0-6 50% SRN w/ sulfer
275 galltote  micros

$3,800/275 gal
28-0-0 x Drexel

66

18-24-12 Rough sized prill

50 Ib bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$44.00/bag

$32.50/BAG lowest cost with correct
analysis

nb

NB

$31.87 per 50LB Bag
Alternate
Armortech 18-20-10

N/A

$41.25 p/bag
50 Ib bag
18-24-12 50% xcu

$59.95/bag
Andersons 18-24-12

6

J

Plant food Calcium Nitrate

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$96.25 please
5 gallon case
Plant Food Calcium
Nitrate

$36.50/50 Ib. bag
yara 15.5-0-0 calcium nitrate

68

Plant Food Sugar Cal No Substitutes

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No bid

No Bid
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TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

631-368-8022

sosullivan@Harrells.com

Shawn O'Sullivan

pat.cash@heritageppg.com
Pat Cash

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

Ken Kraus

John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O

John Banks

dpughe@nsturf.com

Mark Magnarella

Tom Pepe 609-751-1372

LOCAL VENDOR

LOCAL VENDOR

|Cost per case

Bio Performa 6-0-1 Revitilize*

5 galicase

@
©

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Nat Bio Tru Pro 6-2-3
Aaeid $234.00

NB

no bid

395.00 (no subs)

No bid

42/2.5 gal $84.00 solu-cal 6-0-0

Bio Performa 13-0-0 Amino N*

2012 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$650.00
Harrell's Amino ProV

NB

Nat Bio Sea Foliar w/Amino acid
15-0-5 $167.50

NB

no bid

286.50(no subs)

No bid

$68.95/2.5 gal
13-0-0 Lesco Spar Tech
$137.90/5 gal case

Bio Performa Invigorate*

5 galicase

~
iy

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

$383.75

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa 16-0-4*

78 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Nat Bio SeanPower-Foliar
5gl 15-0-5 $167.50

NB

no bid

205.00 (no sub)

No bid

$90/2.5 gal
Progressive 10-3-5
$180/5 gal

Bio Performa 12-0-12*

73 5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$150.00

NB

Nat Bio N Kace
5g1 5-0-20 $47.50

NB

no bid

$214.00

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa BioCal825*

7412 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Elicit Cal/Mg/bo
Nat Bio $159.45

NB

no bid

429.00 (no sub)

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa 5-0-0 Micro Mix*

5 galicase

~
3l

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Elicit-Micros 5gal
Nat Bio $159.45

NB

no bid

245.00 (no sub)

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa 28-0-0 Nitrogen Plus*

7612 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

AaNswer 5gl w /AA
100% Stabilized Nat Bio $104.50

NB

$96.43 per gallon cs.
Alternate
FoliarPAk 30-0-0

$189.00

$121.00 p/case
Equivalent
5 gallon case
N-28-SRN

36.75/2.5 gal $73.50 drexel 28-0-0x

Bio Performa Worm Tee

5 galicase

~
J

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

$149.97 per 5 gallon cs.

$230.00

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa 8% Calcuim Plus*

7812 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Tighten 8% la w kelp
Nat Bio $179.45

NB

no bid

$226.00

No bid

No Bid

Bio Performa Humic Acid 20 %*

79 5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

nb

NB

no bid

215.00 (npo subs)

No bid

48.50/2.50al
Andersons
Ultra mate LQ Humic Acid 12%
$97/5 gal case

Bio Performa Mg Plus Mn Plus B*

) gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Elicit Hi Man 4 min 2ng .5 boron+
Biostim Nat Bio $229.45

NB

no bid

250.00(no subs)

No bid

70/2.5 gal
Keyplex 350
$140/5 gal case

Bio Performa 5% Mn*

5 galicase

]
=

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Triple Green 4 Mn 3Mg
1Fe $104.45

NB

no bid

242.00 (no sub)

$163.00 p/case
Equivalent
5 gallon case
manganese 5%

No Bid

Plant Food Ammonuim Thiosulphate 12-0-0

a2l gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$104.50 p/case
5 gallon case
Ammonium Thiosulfate

No Bid

Plant Food Impulse T*

5 galicase

o]
&)

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

Full House 1-0-4 Cat
Amino acid Nat Bio $157.45

NB

no bid

N/A

$208.75 p/case
5 gallon case
Impulse (no sub)

No Bid

Plant Food 7-0-7 20% Sulpher

84l gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

2x2.5gal
7-0-7
$355.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$109.00 p/case
5 gallons case
7-0-720% S

No Bid

Plant Food pHusion Mn 7% no substitues

85 5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$150.75 p/case
5 gallons case
phusion mn 7%

No Bid

|Plant Food PolyPhosphite 30 no substitues

anl5 gallcase

N/A

N Rid

NR

NR

NR

nn hid

N/A

$223.50 p/case

B nallan raca

N Rid
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TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

631-368-8022

sosullivan@Harrells.com

Shawn O'Sullivan

pat.cash@heritageppg.com
Pat Cash

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

Ken Kraus

John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O

John Banks

dpughe@nsturf.com

Mark Magnarella

Tom Pepe 609-751-1372

LOCAL VENDOR

LOCAL VENDOR

*|Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

S gonoTT CooT

polyphosphite 30

87

Plant Food PolyPhosphite 30 no substitues

Bulk packaging by the ton

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

$6928.00 p/ton
165 gallons in 1 ton
polyphosphite 30

minimum order 1.21 tons (200 gallons)

No Bid

8

2]

Winfield Gravity 38 Special*

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

260 TOTE $65.00/GAL /
2X2.5 $70.00/GAL

The Good Phite 2-0-16
Nat Bio 5.3Ibs A.l $229.45

NB

$293.17 per 5 gallon cs.
Alternate
FP Gold Standard 45

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

89

Lebanon Penn Mulch

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

35.00 BAG

NB

NB

$25.47 per 40LB Bag

N/A

No Bid

$26.90/40 LB bag
Penn Mulch Seed accelerator
26.90/bag

9

o

Harrells Earthmax*

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$240.00/5gal (no subs)

NB

Soil Lyft-mollases 2-3-2
Epson Salt Nat Bio $144.45

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

91

12-0-0 chelated Iron

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$100.00

$42.00/JUG

The Standard 6%w iron 5gl
12-0-0-02 nn mg $94.45

NB

no bid

N/A

$107.75 p/case
5 gallon case
12-Iron 12-0-0

38.25/2.5 gal
Ferromec A/C 15-0-0
$76.50/5 gal case

92

21-0-0 Amm. Sulphate (sprayable)

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$27.00/bag

$50.00/BAG

NB

NB

$21.87 per 51LB Bag

N/A

$34.44 p/bag
50 Ib bag
21-0-0 Amm Sulfate
Sprayable

$28/501b bag
21-0-0 Sprayable

93

46-0-0 100% UMAXX Fairway (sprayable) no subs.

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$55.00/bag

$60.00/BAG

NB

NB

$49.05 per 50LB Bag

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

9

X

46-0-0 100% UFIEXX Fairway (sprayable) no subs.

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

$45.00/bag

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

95

18-0-4 Lebanon Pro 3.38%

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

$29.09 per 50LB Bag
Alternate
Lebanon 16-0-5 w/
38% prodiamine

N/A

No Bid

$28.95/50lb bag
prodiamine
Lebanon 18-0-4 38% Barricade

96

19-0-6 lebanon ProScape Lockup 33% Mesa

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

$39.19 per 40LB Bag

N/A

No Bid

$44/401b bag
19-0-6-Lebanon Proscape
Lockup 33% Mesa

97

0-0-7 lebanon Prodiamine .38%

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

18.95 per bg.

$25.00/bag

NB

0-0-7 .37% 50Ib
Andre and Sons $21.85

NB

$23.37 per 50LB bag

N/A

No Bid

$21.47/401b bag
0-0-7 -Lebanon Prod 38%

89

14-20-12 Starter Fertilizer (Turf Care Supply)

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

$31.87 per 50LB bag

N/A

No Bid

$40/501b bag
TCS 14-20-12

98

20-0-3-Turf (athletic) Fertilizer (Lesco)

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

$28.47 per 50LB Bag
Alternate

N/A

No Bid

28.50/50LB bag
Lebanon PLU 22-0-3

9

©

20-0-5 30% Mesa Lebanon (Turf — athletic fertilizer)

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

29.69 per 50 LB bag

N/A

No Bid

29.95/50 LB bag

100

5-10-5 Tree & Shrub Fertilizer

40 Lb bag check size

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

6-8-6 50Ib
Andre & son $23.45

5-10-5 Tree & Shrub
50 LB Bags
$17.50/50LB. Bag

NB

No Bid

N/A

No Bid

18.50/bag
5-10-5 Shrub & Tree
$18.50/50LB Bag

101

10-10-10 Tree & Shrub Fertilizer

40 Lb bag check size

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

10-10-10 Extra - 50LB
$21.50/50Lb. Bag

NB

$30.63 per 50LB Bag
Alternate
Armortech 14-7-7

N/A

No Bid

$22.90/bag
10-10-10 All mineral
$22.90/50LB bag

102

22-0-4 with Trimec Andersons (Weed & Feed Post Emergence)

40 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

20-0-7 25% Methex w trimec
40Lb. Bag
®2A QQ/ANI R

NB

No Bid

N/A

No bid

$35.50/bag
Andersons 22-0-4



mailto:dwatt@deleasod.com
mailto:sosullivan@Harrells.com
mailto:pat.cash@heritageppg.com
mailto:kenkraus@hotmail.com
mailto:Jbokina@LICASSOC.com
mailto:johnb@maxwellturf.com
mailto:Kleek@nsturf.com
mailto:Nutraturf@gmail.com
mailto:Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com
mailto:Allproposals@siteone.com
mailto:dpughe@nsturf.com

TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

631-368-8022

sosullivan@Harrells.com

Shawn O'Sullivan

pat.cash@heritageppg.com
Pat Cash

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

Ken Kraus

John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O

John Banks

dpughe@nsturf.com

Mark Magnarella

Tom Pepe 609-751-1372

LOCAL VENDOR

LOCAL VENDOR

Cost per bag

Section 5 - Growth Regulators-(non-agency products)

10:

[&]

PGR 113 or generic equivalent

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$140.00/gal
$700/5gal case

T-NEX $315.00PER 2.5GAL

NB

NB

$589.11 per 5 gallcs
Armotech PGR 113

N/A

No Bid

350/2.5 gal
T-Nex
$700 5 gal case

10.

£

Proxy

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$200.00

$165.00 PER 2.5 GAL

NB

NB

$244.05 per 5gallcs
Alternate

QP Ethephon 2 SL

$197.50 pr 5 gallcs

N/A

No Bid

$181/2.5 gal

proxy
$362/5 gal case

Section 6 - Wetting Agents

10

&l

PennHydra

55 gallon tote

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

NB

Aqua advance 55gal 30%
A.l Nat Bio $1608.75

NB

no bid

$4,785.00

No Bid

No Bid

10

>

Harrells Hydro 90*

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$460.00

NB

NB

NB

$437.49 per 5 gallon case

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

10

N

LI 700* no substitutes

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

*DROPLEX $65.00/GAL

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

108

Agqua Aid

55 gallon

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

109

Aqua Aid

275 gallon tote

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

11

o

Wetting agent tablets for a proportioner

pellets/pack

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

$280.00/16count

NB

Surface Pro-Penetrant w/ humic
12pc case $146.00

NB

$349.29 per case
24/80z. Pellets per cs.
SMS 100

N/A

$192.55 per Box
12 pellets per box
A-Plus pellet

No Bid

11

[

Vivax granular or equivalent

50 Lb bag

Product you are bidding on

Cost per bag

N/A

No Bid

$104.41/BAG

Hyderetain QD 40Ib
Ecologel $74.45

NB

$106.41 per 40lb bag
SMS 700G

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

11

N

Duplex Ultra No Substitutes

5 galicase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

$450.00/CASE

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

11

w

Droplex

4 gallcase

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

$65.00/GAL

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

Section 7 —Soil

11

I

USGA Hot Sand

ton delivered

Product you are bidding on

Cost

119.50 per ton

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

115

Washed Fairway/Tee Topdressing sand 2MM

ton delivered

Product you are bidding on

Cost

$49.50 per ton

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

11

o

Quartzite Bunker Sand

ton delivered

Product you are bidding on

Cost

$149.50 per ton

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

117

4MM Topsoil

ton delivered

Product you are bidding on

Cost

$35.00 per cy

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid
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TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

sosullivan@Harrells.com

pat.cash@heritageppg.com

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

631-368-8022 Shawn O'Sullivan Pat Cash Ken Kraus John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O John Banks dpughe@nsturf.com Mark Magnarella Tom Pepe 609-751-1372
LOCAL VENDOR LOCAL VENDOR
Triple Shredded Mulch
11gfyaddelvered $25.00 per cy No Bid NB NB _ NB no bid NIA No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost
Double Shredded Mulch
11opard delivered __ $25.00 per cy No Bid NB NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost
6-2-2 Mixed soil
1pojiondelivered $75.00 per ton No Bid NB NB _ NB no bid NIA No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost
3/8' Blue Stone
1ppfondelivered ___ $59.50 No Bid NB NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost
Premier Pro-mix BX (or equal) Valfei (VM-1)3.9 CuFT
3.8 CU Feet Bag . . . Professional Growe
122 fp—— N/A No Bid NB NB NB no bid N/A No Bid .
Product you are bidding on o 5l - 0 bl 0Bl Mix VM 3.8CuFT
Cost $37.95/bale
Lambert Peat Moss (or Equal)
Howe/Berger
123|38CUFTBag $21.95 per bale No Bid NB NB Lambert Peat Moss NB no bid N/A No Bid Peatmoss 3.8 CuFt
Product you are bidding on $18.50/3.8 cu.ft.
$21.95/bale
Cost
Compost
1244 Yard (Delvered) $35.00 per cy No Bid NB NB _ NB no bid NIA No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding on
Cost
Section 8 - Seed and Sod
Teammates Plus Mix 20%PRG, 70% tall fes., 10% KB
50 Ib bag Teammates Plus Mix 2.35LB
125 p———— — N/A $4.00/1b $250.00/BAG NB NB no bid N/A No Bid Athletic Field Mix
Product you are bidding on $2.15/LB $107.50/50LB Bag $117.50/50LB Bag
Cost per bag
100% Kentucky bluegrass 3B
1062210 bag — N/A $5.00/lb $450.00/BAG NB _ NB $197.15 per 50LB Bag N/A No Bid 50% Shamrock 50% 50% Wildhorse
Product you are bidding on
$150/50LB Bag
Cost per bag
100% Perennial Ryegrass GLS Resisitant 2 50/LB
50 Ib bag 50Ib-Apple, Stellar 100% Perennial Ryegrass . :
127 _Producl vou are bidding on N/A $4.00/Ib $209.00/BAG all star $144.45 $2.40/LB. $107.5/50LB Bag NB $130.55 per 50LB Bag N/A No Bid $1265;_5505;/eBag
Cost per bag
100% Tall Fescue Blend
50 Ib bag Tall Fescue Blend 2.30LB
128 —_ . . NB NB X N/A No Bid 100% Tall fE:
Product you are bidding on NIA $4.00/b F2ES00IBAG $2.04/LB  $102.00/50LB $134.91 per 50LB bag 0 Bl 009% Tall fEscue
$115/50LB Bag
Cost per bag
Native area Fine Fescue variety mix $4.25/LB
50 Ib bag i . All Pro Native Mix
129 f——= — N/A $5.00/Ib $400.00/BAG NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid 50% Beacon Hud Fescue
Product you are bidding on 50% Blue Homet Sheep
Cost per bag $106.25/25LB Bag
Short Cut Kentucky Bluegrass(fairway height)
50 Ib bag . . $4.50/LB
130 —_ N/A No Bid NB NB NB $197.15 per 50LB Ba N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding on - P 9 $225/50LB
Cost per bag
Hard Fescue Mix $4.25/LB
25lb . . Hand Fescue Mix
131 — N/A $4.00/Ib NB NB NB no bid N/A No Bid L
Product you are bidding on - 50% Beacon 50% Viking
Cost $106.25/25 LB Bag
Grass Seed Athletic Mix 70% Tall Fescue/20% Rye/10% Kentucky Blue $2.35/LB
50lb bag . Athletic Mix . . Athletic Mix - Blue/Rye/Tall Fescue
182 oduct you are bidding on /A No Bid $500.00/BAC 85TF10Rye, 5Bb $184.45 $2.151LB  $107.50/ 50LB Bag NE no bid NiA No Bid $117.50/50LB Bag
Cost
ggmj‘ Bimqrass $14.95/LB
133 ucket — N/A No Bid $400.00/BUCKET NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid 007XL
Product you are bidding on $373.25/25LB Bucket
Cost
g;zrs TEurstar Bentgrass $5.95/LB
134 ucket — N/A No Bid NB NB _ NB 179.17 per 25lb bucket N/A No Bid All Pro Tourstar
FC’“":“C‘ you are bidding on $148.75/25LB Bucket
0s

|Kentucky Bluegrass sod
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dpughe@nsturf.com

Mark Magnarella

Tom Pepe 609-751-1372

LOCAL VENDOR

LOCAL VENDOR

135

per square ft

Product you are bidding on

Cost

.52 per sq. ft.

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$.85/sqFt

136

Tall Fescue sod

per square ft

Product you are bidding on

Cost

.54 per sq ft.

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no id

N/A

No Bid

$.87/sqFT

137

Low mow Kentucky blue sod

per square ft

Product you are bidding on

Cost

.56 per sq. ft.

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$.89/sqFT

138

Bentgrass fairway height

per square ft

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

.75 per sq.ft

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$1.13/sqFT

Section 9 - Miscellaneous

20 |P_ar Aide Golf Catalog

% off list

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

25% + Shipping

23% off list

N/A

No Bid

5% off

14

o

Standard Golf Catalog

% off list

N/A

No Bid

NB

NB

20% + Shipping

23% off list

N/A

No Bid

5% off

141

Antifoam or equivalent

bottle/case

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

No Bid

12X1QT PRE FLIGHT
$22.87 PER QT

12 1qt Co Kalo $185.00

NB

$197.61 per case
12x320z. Case
SMS Antifoam

N/A

No Bid

$14/QT
Prime Source Defoamer
$168/case (12 per case)

142

|TDR350 1.5" tines

|per set

N/A

No Bid

$65.94

NB

$72.00/set

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$69/Set

143

TDR250 soil moisture meter**

each

Cost

N/A

No Bid

ITEM 350/ $1495.00

NB

$1300/each

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$1,429.31

144

Harrells PH Buffer no substitutes

bottle/case

Product you are bidding on

Cost per case

N/A

$60.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

14

4l

Andersons/Scotts Accupro Fert spreader commercial

per spreader

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

$665.00

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No bid

$750/Spreader
Andersons Accupro 2000
$750/spreader

146

Andersons/Scotts SR2000 Fert spreader w/shield

per spreader

Product you are bidding on

Cost

N/A

No Bid

$755.82

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$1,100/Spreader

Section 1- Fungicides-(agency products)

147

Affirm WDG"

3 X 2.4lb case

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

$797.76

$265.92 PER 2.41 LB

NB

NB

$797.76 per case

N/A

No Bid

$265.92/2.4lb
Affirm WDG
$797/ 3y 2.4 Ib case

148

Ascernity”

3x1gal

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

$1,491.00
($497/gal)

$497.00 PER GAL

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$473/gal
$1,419/3x1 gal

149

Banner Maxx II"

2x1gal

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

$510.00
($255/gal)

$255.00/GAL

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$243/gal
Banner Maxx Il
$486/2 gal

150

Bayleton Flo®

2x25 gal

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

No Bid

$755.60/GAL

NB

NB

$300 per gallon
alternate
4x1 gal

TIDE Triadimefon

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

151

Briskway”

2x1gal

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

$2,914.00
($1,457/gal)

$1457.00/GAL

NB

Agency $$2914/cs

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$1,388/gal
Briskway
$2,776/2 gal

152

Contend

Product you are bidding

Cost

N/A

$1,138.00

NB

NB

NB

no bid

N/A

No Bid

$1,138/pack
Contend (Local

|Chipco Signature®
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44lbs/case . $1570/case
153 Product you are bidding N/A $1,570.00 $1570.00/CASE NB _ NB $1,570.00 per 44LB Case N/A No Bid Chipco Signature (LocallTie Breaker
Cost
Signature Xtra® 206/5.51b
154f22lbs/case — N/A $824.00 $206.00 PER 5.5LB NB B NB $824..00 per 22LB Case N/A No Bid Signature Xtra
Product you are bidding Local/Tie Breaker $824/22Ib case
Cost
Civitas
1551275 gal — NIA No Bid $36.15/GAL NB _ NB no bid NIA No Bid No Bid
Product you are bidding
Cost
glez;r\é 33I36 301.60/2.5 gal
15622298 — N/A No Bid $368.28 PER 2.5 JUG NB _ NB $697.35 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Cleary 3336
Product you are bidding $603.20/Case (5 gal)
Cost
Daconil Weatherstick” $190/2.5gal
157j2x 2.5 gal — N/A $420.00 $210.00 PER 2.5 NB B Agency $420/cs no bid N/A No Bid Daconil Weather stik
Product you are bidding $380/5 gal case
Cost
Daconil Action® $240/2.5 gal
2x2.5gal . N/A . Daconil Action
158 Broduuct you are bidding N/A $530.00 $265.00 PER 2.5 NB _ Agency $530.00/cs no bid / No Bid $480/5 gal case
Cost
;)fnsicor $725/510z
159 0z — N/A $725.00 $725.00 PER JUG NB _ NB $725.00 per 51 oz. btl N/A No Bid Densicor_(Local/Tie Breaker
Product you are bidding
Cost
AT $322.83/2.5 gal
X—d'gi — N/A $645.64 $322.83/1JUG 2.5 NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Encartis
Product you are bidding $645.66/5 gal (2x2.5 gal case)
Cost
161 WY < $49.21 per 30LB Bag 67.50/25lbs
g ds biadn N/A $70.00/30lbs $67.13 NB $79.80/bag Alternate N/A No Bid Headway G
roduct you are bidding Armor Tech Zoxy PG 67.5/25lbs bag
Cost
Headway”™
$506/1 gal
1622 x 1 gal $1,072.00 . .
N/A ; 536.00/GAL NB 1072/ A bid N/A No Bid 1012/ 2 gal
Product you are bidding (536/gal) $ $ case Agency no ol o Bl $ ga
Cost
Heritage Action®
6 Ib/case . ) 360/1Ib
163 . 78.00/LB NB N/A
Product you are bidding N/A $2,202.00 $378.00/ _ Agency $2268/cs no bid No Bid $2160/61b case
Cost
Heritage TL Linkpak®
10 gal/case . . $5630/LinkPack 10gal
16422 darcase N/A 5,910.00 591.00/GAL NB 5910/cs A bid N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding $ $ - $ Cs Agency nobi 0 Bl HeritageTL Linkpak
Cost
Honor Intrinsic** $4867.20/36LB
165 2‘:(')?“‘;“;’;‘” YT NIA $4,867.20 $4,867.20 NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Honor Intrisic
$135.20/Ib) (Local
Cost ) (Local)
Insignia Intrinsic** 3617.55/2.5 gal
166 12X 5'5 al — N/A $7,225.10 $1445.02/GAL NB B NB no bid N/A No Bid Insignia Intrisic
ngt uct you are bidding $7225.10/2x2.5 gal (Local)
Instrata” 447125 gal
167}2X 25 gal — N/A $940.00 $800/CASE 5 CASE MIN NB _ $940.00/cs no bid N/A No Bid Instrata
Product you are bidding $895/2x2.5 gal
cost :
I2me;fa;ce ?tres_sgﬂrd’\ $1,122.00 per case $561/2.5 gal
168 X—d'gi oad N/A $1,122.00 $224.40/GAL NB _ NB (987.00 per case if 3 Or more N/A No Bid Interface Stressguard
Product you are bidding cases ordered) $1122/2x2.5 gal case
Cost
Lexicon Intrinsic** $2418.36/(4x2107)
1eof2x2x50al N/A $604.59/2102 $542.25 PER 30.5 NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Lexicon
Product you are bidding $2418.36
Cost :
Medillion SC $647/1gal
1 gal . . Medallion SC
17092 N/A 685.00/gal NB NB NB no bid N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding $ 9 - $647/1 gal

Cost
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LOCAL VENDOR LOCAL VENDOR
ngerglljg = $1187.40 case
171 X9. S, — N/A $5,937.00 $118.74/.49LB NB _ NB $1141.70 per case N/A No Bid Emerald
Product you are bidding $5610/50%.49 Ib
Cost )
tmar®
gﬂaletr;a : $2254.20/2.5 gal
172 Px d. 93l Tad N/A $4,508.40 $2254.20/ 2.5 GAL NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Maxitima
C:)ostuct you are bidding $4508.40/2x2.5 gal (Local)
Mirage Stressguard”® $487.20
2x2.5qal $974.40 per 5 gallon case . ;
173jeXL=08 N/A 974.40 487.20 NB NB N N/A No Bid 974.20/2x2.5 gal case
Product you are bidding $ $ - Local/Tie Breaker $ g
Cost
Navicon Intrinsic** $3499/2.5 gal
1 éx 5'5 gl oiddi N/A $6,998.00 $1399.60/GAL NB _ NB no bid N/A No Bid Navicon Intrinsic
CLOStUCI you are bidding $6998/ 2x2.5 gal case_(Local
Posterity® $940/420z.
1754202 — N/A $987.00 105 OZ/ $1704.00 NB _ 2x 105 oz agency $3408.00/cs no bid N/A No Bid Posterity
Product you are bidding $940/42 oz Bottle
Cost
Posterity XT
$610/2.5 gal
1764202 — NIA $1,280.00 2 X2.5 $640.00/2.5 NB _ 2x 2.5 gal $1280/cs no bid NIA No Bid Posterity XT
Product you are bidding (2x2.5gal case) $610/2.5 gal
Cost :
Secure Action”® $1742.50/2.5 gal
1772 5'5 al — N/A $3,485.00 $1742.50/2.5 NB _ $3485/cs no bid N/A No Bid Secure Action
Product you are bidding $3485/2x2.5 gal (Local
Cost
Segway”™ Segway-$436.80
E%(?QVZOZ 65.233.20 per 39.2 07 _ $436.10/39.2 0z
178 . — N/A ! y $436.10/JUG NB _ NB alternate N/A No Bid Secure Action
Product you are bidding (436.10/bottle) Armortech CYA 345 $399.95 per $3485/2x2.5 gal (Local)
Cost $39.2 0z
Subdue Maxx Linkpak” $5630/10 gsl Linkpak
P ] Ll — N/A $5,910.00 $591.00/GAL NB _ Agency $5910/cs No Bid N/A No Bid Subdue Maxx
Product you are bidding 5630/10 gal Link Pak
Cost
Subdue Maxx”
T $2,444.00 ) ) $582/gal
180 — N/A $611.00/GAL NB _ 2x 1 gal Agency $1222/cs No Bid N/A No Bid Subdue Maxx
Product you are bidding (611.00 gal) 2328/4x1 gal
Cost
Wﬂ%’d $2066.00 per case 1033/2.5 gal
181 X—d'gi oad N/A $2,066.00 $375.68/2.5 NB _ NB Buy 3 or more cases N/A No Bid Tartan Stressguard
Product you are bidding $1878.40 per case $2066/2x2.5 gal
Cost
Tourney
$735/5lb
182X 3l _ N/A $2,940.00 $735.00/5LB NB _ NB $2940.00 per 4x5 LB Case N/A No Bid Tourney
product you are offering Local/Tie Breaker $2940/ 4x5Ib
cost
Velista® $264/220z
183 N/A $1,716.00 NB NB _ NB No Bid N/A No Bid Velista
6 x 220z $1584/6x220Z
Dimension 2 EW** $695/2.5
184}2X2.5 gal — N/A $1,155.76 $231.15/GAL NB _ NB $1155.72 per 5 gallon case N/A No Bid Dimension eEW
Product you are bidding $1390/2x2.5 gal
Cost :
185]Speed Zone $120/gal
4 x 1 gal __ N/A No Bid $499.00/CASE NB _ NB $506.00 per 5 galon case N/A No Bid Spectrone
Product you are bidding 2x2.5 gal 480/4X1 gal
Cost
Section 3 - Insecticides-(agency products)
Acelepryn 1137.50/.5¢
.50/.5gal
186 rxoigti\'mu e N/A $4,550.00 ﬁ?\fg?ﬁ ,§1E1E3D7'E5§ NB _ Agency $4550/cs no bid NIA No Bid Acelepryn
: $4550/4x.5 gal (Local
Cost g
leilepryn G 109.38/25lbs
187 S e N/A $98.00 NB NB _ NB No bid N/A No Bid Acelepryn G
Product you are bidding 109.38/25lbs
Cost )
|D|vanem $1838/.5gal
129 2X.5 qgl N/A @2 72R NN ®1 202 NN NR Anencyv R272R /e Nn hid N/A N Rid Nivvanam
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TNH010-2023
Turf Management Products

Delea Sod Farms

Harrell's LLC

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc

Island Bio Greens

Long Island Cauliflower association

Maxwell Turf Supply

Nassau Suffolk Turf Services, Inc.

Nutra Turf Corporation

Plant Food Company

Site One Landscape Supply

444 Elwood Rd

5105 New Tampa Hwy

7440 State Highway 121

7 County Club Drive

139 Marcy ave.

414 Long Island Ave

60 Gazza Blvd.

305 Crump St.

38 Highstown -Cranbury Station Rd.

300 Colonial Pkwy. Unit 600

E. Northport, NY 11731

Lakeland, FL 33815

McKinney, Texas 75070

Shelter Island Hights, NY 11965

Riverhead, NY 11901

Wyandanch, NY 11798

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Goldsboro, NC 27530

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Roswell, GA 30076

631-368-8022 ext 1414

516-214-8746

516-639-7784

516--658-8318

Phone 631-727-2212

631-643-8873

631-694-0441

919-288-1291

609-448-0935

631-789-6680

dwatt@deleasod.com

sosullivan@Harrells.com

pat.cash@heritageppg.com

kenkraus@hotmail.com

Jbokina@LICASSOC.com

johnb@maxwellturf.com

Kleek@nsturf.com

Nutraturf@gmail.com

Sberezansky@plantfoodco.com

Allproposals@siteone.com

631-368-8022 Shawn O'Sullivan Pat Cash Ken Kraus John E. Bokina. Jr. C.E.O John Banks dpughe@nsturf.com Mark Magnarella Tom Pepe 609-751-1372
LOCAL VENDOR LOCAL VENDOR
™| Broduct you are bidding ~ ToToooo TIoooo0 ) — ErEID A oo ~ oo $36.,7672;5ga‘
Cost )
Ference®
1824/960z
2 x 960z $1728.00 OR $1920.00 . .
189 N/A 3,840.00 NB Agency $3840/c: No Bid N/A No Bid Fi
Product you are bidding $ DEPENDS ON QUANTITY - gency $ S o B 3648296 02
Cost
Tetrino $498/gal
4x1gal . . Tetrino
190jAX 298 N/A 1,992.00 NB NB NB No Bid N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding $ - 1992/4x1 gal (Local)
Cost
Matchpoint**
852.80/64
191 4xBdoz — N/A $3,411.20 $852.80 NB _ NB $852.80 per 64 0z. bl. N/A No Bid Matchpoint
product you are bidding $3,411.20 per 4x64 0z case 3411.20/4x640z.(LocallTie Breaker)
Cost : :
i’(;lmol Maxx Link Pak® 2990/10 gal link pack
192 P—%i Tad N/A $2,990.00 $299.00/GAL NB _ Agency $2990.00/case No Bid N/A No Bid Primo Maxx
Croostum You are biading 2990/10 gal link pack (Local)
Primo Maxx** 317/gal
2x1gal . . Primo Maxx
193 N/A 634.00 317.00/GAL NB Agency $634.00/case No Bid N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding 8 8 - gency $ o Bl 634/2x1 gal(Local)
Cost
Trimmit® 555/1gal
194 %ﬂ%’wu YT N/A $2,220.00 2X 2.5 $1270.00/2.5 NB _ Agency $2540.00/case No Bid N/A No Bid Trimmit
$2220/4x1 gal(Local
Cost vallLocal)
Pylex
407 . . $344/40z
195 N/A 344.00 344 NB NB No Bid N/A No Bid
Product you are bidding 8 8 - o Bl Pylex(Local)
Cost
Pennant Magnum
196 N/A No Bid NB NB NB N/A No Bid No Bid

Product you are bidding

Cost
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