
Twin County Swimming Pool Tortorella AutoChem LLC Commercial Clearwater
797 Conklin Street 296 W. Montauk Highway P.O Box 909

Farmingdale, NY 11735 Hampton Bays, NY 11946 Plandome, NY 11030
Randy P. Cestaro Jacqualine Kopcho Keith Meilink

631-249-1249 631-283-7398 516-294-7985
Fran@TwinCountypools.com Info@autochemcorp.com keith@commercialclearwater.com
krissy@twincountypools.com

Item # Item description Size Price Price Price
1 Diatomaceous earth, John Mansville 25 lb. bag

# DE545 or equal, now called aquacell $29.45 $39.95 $31.75
*Include brand you are bidding Splash/Celaton

2 Sodium Bicarbonate, Powder 50 lb. container $41.50 bags, $46.00 $51.82

3 Calcium Hypochlorite, granular 100 lb. container
unstabilized, 65% available chlorine

4 Sodium Hypochlorite, 15%, delivered 600 gallon truckload $3.95/GAL $3.45 No Bid

5 Muriatic Acid 5 gallon N/A $52.00+ Deposit $9.00 $55.43 + $9 deposit

6 Muriatic Acid 1 gallon $35.00/CASE4XL GALS $14.85 (case of 4) $13.00

7 Oxalic Acid 50 lb. bag N/A No Bid $220.00

8 Testing tablets #1 Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $64.95 BOX $79.00 $69.95
*Include brand you are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

9 Testing Tablet # 3 Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $64.95 BOX $79.00 $69.95
*Include brand you are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

10 Testing Tablet Phenol red, Lamotte or equal 1000 tablets $64.95 BOX $79.00 $69.95
*Include Brand you are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

11 Testing Tablets, Calcium Hardness 1000 tablets $64.95 BOX $79.00 $69.95
*Brand you are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

12 Testing Tablets Alkalinity M/2 1000 tablets $64.95 BOX $79.00 $69.95
*Brand You are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

13 Lamotte test kits, Model # PM 51NJ, or equivalent Each $140.50 EA $145.00 $144.59
*Brand you are bidding LAMOTTE Lamotte

14 Plastic test tubes for water testing 24 tubes $182.40 (7.60 EA) $14.00/each, $336.00 for 24 $179.04 (7.46 ea)

15 Tri-Sodium Phosphate 50 lb. container N/A No Bid $170.15

50 lb. bag
With 50 bag minimum delivery

17 25 lb bags purifier 100 bags N/A No Bid $9,975 (99.75 ea)

18 Algaecide Case of quart size Bottles N/A $350.00 $221.48 case of 12

19 Metal Out or equivalent Case of quart size Bottles N/A $300.00 $215.57 case of 12

20 Sodium Thiosulfate 5 lb containers N/A No Bid $138.58 50lb bag

21 3 1/8 “ calcium hypochlorite Tablets, Hydrated 55 lbs 60LB $315.00 EA, ACCU-TABS BLUE SI $400.00 No Bid

22 Pulsar Tablets (no substitutes) 50 lb container N/A No Bid $185.00

23 Imerys Harborlite Aquaperl Perlite Filter Media (no 
substitutes)

25 lb bag N/A $39.75 $63.54

24 Chlorine Neutralizer 25 lb N/A $99.00 $121.28

25 Chlorine Neutralizer 3 lb N/A No Bid $38.02 5lb

26 Sodium Carbonate 50 lb bag $41.50 EA $49.00 $44.00

27 Pool Clarifier 1 Quart Bottle $23.50 QT SUPER BLUE $15.00 $16.24

28 Pulsar Acid Cleaner 1 Quart Bottle N/A No Bid $14.85

29 Hourly Rate for Repairs During Regular Business Hours: M-F, 
8am-4pm

NO BID No Bid $183.00

30 Labor Rate – After hours, Overtime and Holidays NO BID No Bid $274.50

31 Parts – Bid as Percentage above Certified Cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost

32 Equipment – Bid as Percentage above Certified Cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost Town will pay 15% above certified cost

33 CPO Training Class – Price per class (includes two participants) NO BID No Bid $3000 (includes 10 students)

34 CPO Training Class – Additional Cost per participant NO BID No Bid $375

Items #18 & #19 are not being awarded as the town 
mistakenly did not specify case size

Item #21 is not being awarded as it is no longer needed

TNH040-2024 Pool Chemicals

N/A $395.00 $420.21

16 Calcium Chloride Flakes, 77% $39.50 EA $39.50 $39.00 ea
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